
DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Type "P" TS2 Base Cabinet 1 each No Bid No Bid $13,750.00 $13,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "M" TS2 Base Cabinet 1 each No Bid No Bid $12,500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Solid State Dual Circuit Flasher 12 each No Bid No Bid $19.30 $231.60 $20.00 $240.00 $19.00 $228.00 $23.00 $276.00

Solid State Load Switch 12 each No Bid No Bid $19.30 $231.60 $20.00 $240.00 $20.31 $243.72 $23.00 $276.00

Flash Transfer Relay 12 each No Bid No Bid $21.90 $262.80 $20.00 $240.00 $23.19 $278.28 $23.00 $276.00

Loop Detector - Dual Channel, Rack Mount, TS2 8 each No Bid No Bid $107.00 $856.00 $144.00 $1,152.00 $116.50 $932.00 $85.00 $680.00

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Conflict Monitor - NEMA 12 Standard 6 each No Bid No Bid $535.70 $3,214.20 $602.00 $3,612.00 $688.00 $4,128.00 $675.00 $4,050.00

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Conflict Monitor - NEMA 12 Enhanced-Must have red 
monitor inibit feature 6 each No Bid No Bid $825.00 $4,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TS2 Malfunction Management Unit 10 each No Bid No Bid $650.00 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TS2 Malfunction Management Unit, Flashing Arrow Co 2 each No Bid No Bid $875.00 $1,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Conflict Monitor - Naztec NM512-E123 LCD 6 each No Bid No Bid $825.00 $4,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Iteris Vantage Video Detection Camera 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Iteris Edge Dual Channel Processor 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Iteris Edge Single Channel Processor 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mounting Hardware for Iteris Vantage Video Detection 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9-Inch Monitor, KM0900MN 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Iteris Lens Adjustment Module 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1,000 Foot roll of Belden Cable, 828-3 cond wire in 
jacket for camera 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Signal Head with LED's - 3 section horizontal, black 
polycarbonate, 12-inch LED with visors, back plate, 
arms (AB-4001) and tube

8 each $314.00 $2,512.00 No Bid No Bid $390.00 $3,120.00 $305.50 $2,444.00 No Bid No Bid

Signal Head with LED's - 4 section horizontal, black 
polycarbonate, 12-inch LED with visors, back plate, 
arms (AB-4001) and tube

4 each $394.00 $1,576.00 No Bid No Bid $520.00 $2,080.00 $402.30 $1,609.20 No Bid No Bid

Signal Head with LED's - 5 section horizontal, black 
polycarbonate, 12-inch LED with visors, back plate, 
arms (AB-4001) and tube

4 each $487.00 $1,948.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00 $2,600.00 $505.00 $2,020.00 No Bid No Bid

16" Pedestrian Signal - 2 in 1, black, LED, hand/man 8 each $176.00 $1,408.00 No Bid No Bid $338.00 $2,704.00 $199.88 $1,599.04 No Bid No Bid

16" Pedestrian Signal - 2 in 1, black, incandescent 8 each $44.00 $352.00 No Bid No Bid $320.00 $2,560.00 $165.00 $1,320.00 No Bid No Bid

12" Pedestrian Signal Lens - Plastic, WALK 8 each $25.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $224.00 $90.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid

12" Pedestrian Signal Lens - Plastic, DON'T WALK 8 each $25.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $224.00 $90.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid

Pedestrian Push Button - Black, ADA 8 each $84.00 $672.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $880.00 $29.00 $232.00 No Bid No Bid

Pedestal Base - Pelco PB-5335 or Approved Equal; 
Plastic door, collar, and anchor bolts 10 each $225.00 $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid $220.00 $2,200.00 $182.36 $1,823.60 No Bid No Bid

Paradigm Traffic Systems, 
Inc

Arlington, TX
817-831-9406

BID SECTION #2 TOTAL No Bid

BID SECTION #3 TOTAL No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Traffic Parts, Inc
Spring, TX

800-345-6329

MoboTrex, Inc
Austin, TX

512-521-3337

Tabulation of Bids Received
on August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM

Traffic Signal Equipment & Supplies
Bid # 28-01-21

BIDDERS

BID SECTION #1 - SIGNAL CABINETS WITH CONTROLLERS (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #2 - MISCELLANEOUS COMPONENTS (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #3 - CONFLICT MONITOR WITHOUT RED LIGHT INHIBITOR (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #4 - CONFLICT MONITOR WITH RED LIGHT INHIBITOR (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #5 - VIDEO DETECTION EQUIPMENT (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #6 - SIGNAL HEADS, BRACKETS, LENSES, AND ACCESSORIES (AWARDED BY SECTION)

Cubic ITS, Inc
Sugar Land, TX
281-269-6504

$3,214.20 $3,612.00

$18,150.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Consolidated Traffic 
Controls, Inc
Arlington, TX
817-265-3421

$26,250.00

BID SECTION #4 TOTAL

BID SECTION #5 TOTAL

No Bid

$1,582.00 $1,872.00

BID SECTION #1 TOTAL No Bid No Bid 

$1,682.00

$4,128.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,508.00

$4,050.00

No Bid

No Bid



Paradigm Traffic Systems, 
Inc

Arlington, TX
817-831-9406

Traffic Parts, Inc
Spring, TX

800-345-6329

MoboTrex, Inc
Austin, TX

512-521-3337

Tabulation of Bids Received
on August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM

Traffic Signal Equipment & Supplies
Bid # 28-01-21

BIDDERS

          

Cubic ITS, Inc
Sugar Land, TX
281-269-6504

Consolidated Traffic 
Controls, Inc
Arlington, TX
817-265-3421

Pole Cap - Pelco PB-5401 or Approved Equal 1 each $14.00 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $16.00 $14.52 $14.52 No Bid No Bid

4-1/2" OD x 16" Aluminum Pole for Ped Base - Pelco 
PB-5100 or Approved Equal 1 each $300.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid $295.00 $295.00 $367.00 $367.00 No Bid No Bid

U-Bolt Sign Clamp - 4" Pole (4-1/2" ID) - Pelco SH-
0206 or Approved Equal 10 each $11.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $200.00 $20.34 $203.40 No Bid No Bid

Astro Bracket – AS-3009; 62-Inch Cable 12 each $74.00 $888.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 $840.00 $66.98 $803.76 No Bid No Bid

Astro Bracket – AS-3009; 84-Inch Cable 12 each $79.00 $948.00 No Bid No Bid $78.00 $936.00 $69.26 $831.12 No Bid No Bid

Astro Bracket – AS-3009; 96-Inch Cable 12 each $82.00 $984.00 No Bid No Bid $80.00 $960.00 $73.00 $876.00 No Bid No Bid

Astro Arm Kit – AB-4001 12 each $35.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $336.00 $23.00 $276.00 No Bid No Bid

12” LED – Red 12 each $39.00 $468.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $288.00 $35.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid

12” LED – Yellow 12 each $39.00 $468.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $288.00 $38.13 $457.56 No Bid No Bid

12” LED – Green 12 each $39.00 $468.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $288.00 $35.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid

12” LED – Yellow Arrow 12 each $41.00 $492.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 $432.00 $40.00 $480.00 No Bid No Bid

12” LED – Green Arrow 12 each $41.00 $492.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 $432.00 $49.00 $588.00 No Bid No Bid

8” LED – Red 12 each $38.00 $456.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $504.00 $40.00 $480.00 No Bid No Bid

8" LED - Yellow 12 each $38.00 $456.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $504.00 $40.00 $480.00 No Bid No Bid

8” LED – Green 12 each $38.00 $456.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $504.00 $40.00 $480.00 No Bid No Bid

8” LED – Yellow Arrow 12 each $56.00 $672.00 No Bid No Bid $92.00 $1,104.00 $49.00 $588.00 No Bid No Bid

8” LED – Green Arrow 12 each $56.00 $672.00 No Bid No Bid $92.00 $1,104.00 $69.00 $828.00 No Bid No Bid

12” Visor – Universal Black Plastic Tunnel 50 each $10.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $800.00 $10.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid

12” Visor – Universal Yellow Metal Tunnel 50 each $13.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $1,200.00 $17.85 $892.50 No Bid No Bid

8” Visor – Universal Yellow Metal Tunnel 50 each $13.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $1,200.00 $12.47 $623.50 No Bid No Bid

12” Pedestrian Visor – Black Plastic 12 each $13.00 $156.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $288.00 $10.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

17” x 34” x 12” Service Box 8 each $240.00 $1,920.00 No Bid No Bid $495.00 $3,960.00 $217.50 $1,740.00 No Bid No Bid

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
12-Volt Gell Cell Batteries for Solar Flashers-
Minimum 90 Amp Hour 6 each $424.00 $2,544.00 $325.00 $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid $285.00 $1,710.00 No Bid No Bid

Credit Check Authorization 

Local Preference

YesYes

BID SECTION #7 - BATTERIES (AWARDED BY SECTION)

BID SECTION #7 TOTAL $2,544.00

$32,477.20

Yes

No Bid

$23,758.00

No

$38,555.00

NoNo

$5,558.00

No

Yes

No

No Bid

Yes

$33,071.00

$1,950.00

$51,146.20Total Bid Amount $26,302.00

BID SECTION #6 TOTAL

$1,710.00

$24,957.20 No Bid

No Bid

$1,508.00Total Recommended for Award $23,758.00 $47,614.20 $0.00 $1,710.00
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