CITY OF

7' TEMPLE

Bid Tabulation

City of Temple

Traffic Signal Equipment & Supplies Bid #28-01-25
Opened Thursday, August 15, 2024 @ 3:00pm

Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. Cubic ITS, Inc. General Traffic Equipment Corp
Arlington, TX Sugar Land, TX Newburgh, NY
817-233-9851 281-240-7233 845-569-9000
Section 1 - Miscellaneous
Components ey UOM | Unit Price | Total Price LERIIEEEy || iyl Unit Price | Total Price LIy || @enisy el Unit Price | Total Price L ey Counayvicl
q Qty Name Manufacture Name Manufacture Name Manufacture
(Awarded by Section)
Solid State Dual Circuit Flasher 12 each $32.00 $384.00 TsC USA $56.00 $672.00 EDI USA $35.00 $420.00 PDC USA
Solid State Load Switch 12 each $32.00 $384.00 TSC USA $31.00 $372.00 EDI USA $30.00 $360.00 PDC USA
Flash Transfer Relay 12 each $32.00 $384.00 TsC USA $34.00 $408.00 RENO USA $35.00 $420.00 PDC USA
SECTION 1 - MISCELLANEOUS COMPONTENTS
TOTAL BID PRICE $1,152.00 $1452.00 $1,200.00
Globe Electric Supply Co. MoboTrex, Inc. Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Houston, TX Pflugerville, TX Arlington, TX
832-791-2940 512-521-3337 817-831-9406
Section 1 - Miscellaneous
Components Estingal UOM | Unit Price | Total Price fapuizctueg(iCou vl Unit Price | Total Price fapischueg sty Unit Price | Total Price Mepulacioey Countvel
. Qty Name Manufacture Name Manufacture Name Manufacture
(Awarded by Section)
Solid State Dual Circuit Flasher 12 each $26.60 $319.20 Swarco USA $28.00 $336.00 EDI USA $33.00 $396.00 Eberle Design Inc. USA
Solid State Load Switch 12 each $26.60 $319.20 Swarco USA $28.00 $336.00 EDI USA $31.00 $372.00 Eberle Design Inc. USA
Flash Transfer Relay 12 each $26.60 $319.20 Swarco USA $25.00 $300.00 Struthers Dunn USA $35.00 $420.00 Eberle Design Inc. USA
SECTION 1 - MISCELLANEOUS COMPONTENTS
TOTAL BID PRICE $957.60 $972.00 $1,188.00
Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. Cubic ITS, Inc. General Traffic Equipment Corp
Arlington, TX Sugar Land, TX Newburgh, NY
817-233-9851 281-240-7233 845-569-9000
Section 2 - Batteries Est Annual o 5 Manufacturer Country of P . Manufacturer Country of Dy . Manufacturer Country of
(i ) aty UOM | Unit Price | Total Price e s Ny Unit Price | Total Price I Manufacture Unit Price | Total Price Name Manufacture
12-Volt Gel Cell Batteries for Solar . .
No Bid No Bid
Fiashers, Minimum 90 Amp Hour 6 each $463.00 $2,778.00 Interstate o Bi o Bi
SECTION 2 - BATTERIES . .
TOTAL BID PRICE $2,778.00 No Bid No Bid
Globe Electric Supply Co. MoboTrex, Inc. Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Houston, TX Pflugerville, TX Arlington, TX
832-791-2940 512-521-3337 817-831-9406
Section 2 - Batteries Est Annual o 5 Manufacturer Country of P . Manufacturer Country of Dy . Manufacturer Country of
(i ) aty UOM | Unit Price | Total Price e s Ny Unit Price | Total Price I Manufacture Unit Price | Total Price Name Manufacture
12-Volt Gel Cell Batteries for Solar . Alpha
Flashers, Minimum 90 Amp Hour 6 each No Bid $275.00 | $1,650.00 MK BATTERY USA $265.00 | $1,590.00 | . CE USA
SECTION 2 - BATTERIES .
TOTAL BID PRICE No Bid $1,650.00 $1,590.00
Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. Cubic ITS, Inc. General Traffic Equipment Corp
Arlington, TX Sugar Land, TX Newburgh, NY
817-233-9851 281-240-7233 845-569-9000
Section 3 - Signal Heads, Brackets,
Lenses, & Accessories Estdnzeal UOM | Unit Price | Total Price fapuisctueg(iCous ] Unit Price | Total Price fapeischuey ST el Unit Price | Total Price Mepulacioey Countvel
; Qty Name Manufacture Name Manufacture Name Manufacture
(Awarded by Line Item)
16" Pedestrian Signal, 2 in 1, black, Swarco / McCain / . " :
LED. hand/man 8 each $377.00 $3,016.00 Leotek Mecico/Taiwan No Bid $275.00 $2,200.00 GTE CORP USA
Pedestrian Push Button, Black, ADA 8 each $108.00 $864.00 Polara USA No Bid $45.00 $360.00 GTE CORP USA
Pedestal Base, Plastic Door, Collar, and
Anchor Bolts, Pelco PB-5335 NO 10 each $211.00 $2,110.00 PELCO USA No Bid $225.00 $2,250.00 GTE CORP USA
SUBSTITUTIONS
Pole Cap, Pelco PB-5401 NO .
SUBSTITUTIONS 1 each $18.00 $18.00 PELCO USA No Bid $20.00 $20.00 GTE CORP USA
4-1/2" OD x 16" Aluminum Pole for Ped
Base, Pelco PB-5100 NO 1 each $456.00 $456.00 PELCO USA No Bid No Bid
SUBSTITUTIONS
U-Bolt Sign Clamp - 4" Pole (4-1/2" OD), No Bid No Bid
Pelco SH-0206 NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 each $44.00 $440.00 PELCO USA o Bi o Bi
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 62-Inch Cable 12 each $111.00 $1,332.00 PELCO USA No Bid $100.00 $1,200.00 GTE CORP USA
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 84-Inch Cable 12 each $112.00 $1,344.00 PELCO USA No Bid $105.00 $1,260.00 GTE CORP USA
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 96-Inch Cable 12 each $113.00 $1,356.00 PELCO USA No Bid $118.00 $1,416.00 GTE CORP USA
Astro Arm Kit - Ab-4001 12 each $64.00 $768.00 PELCO USA No Bid $40.00 $480.00 GTE CORP USA
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12R-DT-A1) - Red, Equipped with Dual 50 each $59.00 $2,950.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12Y-DT-A1) - Yellow, Equipped with Dual 50 each $59.00 $2,950.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12G-DT-A1) - Green, Equipped with Dual 50 each $59.00 $2,950.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12RA-
DT-A1) - Red Arrow, Equipped with Dual 20 each $61.00 $1,220.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12YA-
DT-A1) - Yellow Arrow, Equipped with 20 each $61.00 $1,220.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12GA-
DT-A1) - Green Arrow, Equipped with 20 each $61.00 $1,220.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal




CITY OF

7' TEMPLE

Bid Tabulation
City of Temple
Traffic Signal Equipment & Supplies Bid #28-01-25
Opened Thursday, August 15, 2024 @ 3:00pm

Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.
Arlington, TX
817-233-9851

Cubic ITS, Inc.
Sugar Land, TX
281-240-7233

General Traffic Equipment Corp
Newburgh, NY
845-569-9000

Section 3 - Signal Heads, Brackets,

Lenses, & Accessories S AITEY UOM | Unit Price | Total Price LERIIEEGEY || Lyl Unit Price | Total Price LAy || ey el Unit Price | Total Price LEIEEIEr || Ryl
n Qty Name Manufacture Name Manufacture Name Manufacture
(Awarded by Line Item)
Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-1210-013X15WI) - Red, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or %0 each o B o B o=l
equal
Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-3235-911XL15) - Yellow, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or %0 each o=l o B o=l
equal
Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-1215-013XL15) - Green, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or %0 each o=l o B o B
equal
Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (432-
1314-001XOD15) - Red Arrow, Equipped 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid
with Dual End Connectors or equal
Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (431-
3334-901X0OD15) - Yellow Arrow, . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or 2 each o=l o B o=l
equal
Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (432-
2324-001X0OD15) - Green Arrow, . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or 2 each o=l o=l o=l
equal
Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08R{
DT-A1) - Red, Equipped with Dual End 15 each $59.00 $885.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08Y-|
DT-A1) - Yellow, Equipped with Dual End 15 each $59.00 $885.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08G|
DT-A1) - Green, Equipped with Dual End 15 each $59.00 $885.00 Leotek Taiwan No Bid No Bid
Connectors or equal
Dialight 8" LED arrow 120v AC (433-
3634-001) - Yellow Arrow; Equipped with 15 each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
Dialight 8" LED arrow 120v AC (433-
2624-001) - Green Arrow; Equipped with 15 each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
lﬁnX'eT"' - Universal Black Plastic 50 each | $25.00 | $1,250.00 | Swarco/McCain Mexico No Bid $20.00 | $1,000.00 GTE CORP UsA
lﬁnX'eT"' - Universal Yellow Metal 50 each | $25.00 | $1,250.00 | Swarco/McCain Mexico No Bid $25.00 | $1,250.00 GTE CORP UsA
8" Visor - Universal Yellow Metal Tunnel 50 each $12.00 $600.00 Swarco / McCain Mexico No Bid $18.00 $900.00 GTE CORP USA
17" x 34" x 12" Service Box, Precast, 8 each | $500.00 | $4,000.00 Techline UsA No Bid No Bid
polymet concrete
Globe Electric Supply Co. MoboTrex, Inc. Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Houston, TX Pflugerville, TX Arlington, TX
832-791-2940 512-521-3337 817-831-9406
Section 3 - Signal Heads, Brackets,
Lenses, & Accessories S AITEY UOM | Unit Price | Total Price LERIIEEIGEY || Culiay el Unit Price | Total Price LAy || ey el Unit Price | Total Price LEIEEIEr || Ryl
n Qty Name Manufacture Name Manufacture Name Manufacture
(Awarded by Line Item)
16" Pedestrian Signal, 2 in 1, black, 8 each $122.34 $978.72 Swarco USA $360.00 $2,880.00 MOBOTREX USA $475.00 $3,800.00 [SWARCO / McCAIN USA
LED, hand/man
Pedestrian Push Button, Black, ADA 8 each $132.98 $1,063.84 Swarco USA $140.00 $1,120.00 POLARA USA $67.00 $536.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Pedestal Base, Plastic Door, Collar, and
Anchor Bolts, Pelco PB-5335 NO 10 each $204.26 $2,042.60 Swarco USA $310.00 $3,100.00 PELCO USA $350.00 $3,500.00 Pelco, Inc USA
SUBSTITUTIONS
Pole Cap, Pelco PB-5401 NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 1 each $20.21 $20.21 Swarco USA $18.00 $18.00 PELCO USA $21.00 $21.00 Pelco, Inc USA
4-1/2" OD x 16" Aluminum Pole for Ped
Base, Pelco PB-5100 NO 1 each $419.15 $419.15 Swarco USA $340.00 $340.00 PELCO USA $445.00 $445.00 Pelco, Inc USA
SUBSTITUTIONS
U-Bolt Sign Clamp - 4" Pole (4-1/2" OD),
Pelco SH-0206 NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 each $29.79 $297.90 Swarco USA $32.00 $320.00 PELCO USA $30.00 $300.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 62-Inch Cable 12 each $105.32 $1,263.84 Swarco USA $98.00 $1,176.00 PELCO USA $110.00 $1,320.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 84-Inch Cable 12 each $106.38 $1,276.56 Swarco USA $105.00 $1,260.00 PELCO USA $112.00 $1,344.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Astro Bracket - AS-3009; 96-Inch Cable 12 each $107.45 $1,289.40 Swarco USA $115.00 $1,380.00 PELCO USA $113.00 $1,356.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Astro Arm Kit - Ab-4001 12 each $54.26 $651.12 Swarco USA $38.00 $456.00 PELCO USA $60.00 $720.00 Pelco, Inc USA
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12R-DT-A1) - Red, Equipped with Dual 50 each $63.83 $3,191.50 Swarco USA No Bid No Bid
End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12Y-DT-A1) - Yellow, Equipped with 50 each $63.83 $3,191.50 Swarco USA No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-
12G-DT-A1) - Green, Equipped with 50 each $65.83 $3,291.50 Swarco USA No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12RA-
DT-A1) - Red Arrow, Equipped with 20 each $61.70 $1,234.00 Swarco USA No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal
Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12YA-
DT-A1) - Yellow Arrow, Equipped with 20 each $61.70 $1,234.00 Swarco USA No Bid No Bid
Dual End Connectors or equal




CITY OF

7' TEMPLE

Bid Tabulation

City of Temple

Traffic Signal Equipment & Supplies Bid #28-01-25
Opened Thursday, August 15, 2024 @ 3:00pm

Globe Electric Supply Co.
Houston, TX
832-791-2940

MoboTrex, Inc.
Pflugerville, TX
512-521-3337

Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Arlington, TX
817-831-9406

Section 3 - Signal Heads, Brackets,
Lenses, & Accessories
(Awarded by Line Item)

Est Annual

oty uom

Unit Price

Manufacturer
Name

Country of

Total Price Manufacture

Unit Price

Manufacturer
Name

Country of

Total Price Manufacture

Unit Price

Manufacturer
Name

Country of

Total Price Manufacture

Leo Tech 12" LED Arrows (TSL-12GA-
DT-A1) - Green Arrow, Equipped with
Dual End Connectors or equal

20 each

$61.70

$1,234.00 Swarco

No Bid

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-1210-013X15W1) - Red,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

50 each

$58.51

$2,925.50

Swarco

$50.00

$2,500.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-3235-911XL15) - Yellow,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

50 each

$58.51

$2,925.50 Swarco

$52.00

$2,600.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED ball 120v AC ITE Long
Life (433-1215-013XL15) - Green,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

50 each

$63.83

$3,191.50

Swarco

$51.00

$2,550.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (432-
1314-001X0OD15) - Red Arrow,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

20 each

$69.15

$1,383.00 Swarco

$55.00

$1,100.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (431-
3334-901X0OD15) - Yellow Arrow,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

20 each

$69.15

$1,383.00 Swarco USA

$59.00

$1,180.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Dialight 12" LED Arrows 120v AC (432-
2324-001X0OD15) - Green Arrow,
Equipped with Dual End Connectors or
equal

20 each

$69.15

$1,383.00 Swarco USA

$59.00

$1,180.00 DIALIGHT CHINA

No Bid

Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08R{
DT-A1) - Red, Equipped with Dual End 15
Connectors or equal

each

$47.87

$718.05 Swarco

No Bid

No Bid

Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08Y
DT-A1) - Yellow, Equipped with Dual 15
End Connectors or equal

each

$47.87

$718.05

Swarco

No Bid

No Bid

Leo Tech 8" LED ball 120v AC (TSL-08G|
DT-A1) - Green, Equipped with Dual End 15
Connectors or equal

each

$47.87

$718.05 Swarco

No Bid

No Bid

Dialight 8" LED arrow 120v AC (433-
3634-001) - Yellow Arrow; Equipped 15
with Dual End Connectors or equal

each

$88.30

Swarco

$1,324.50

No Bid

No Bid

Dialight 8" LED arrow 120v AC (433-
2624-001) - Green Arrow; Equipped 15
with Dual End Connectors or equal

each

$88.30

$1,324.50 Swarco

No Bid

No Bid

12" Visor - Universal Black Plastic

Tunnel .

each

$10.64

$532.00

Swarco

$14.00

$700.00 MOBOTREX

$17.00

$850.00

Econolite

12" Visor - Universal Yellow Metal

50
Tunnel

each

$21.23

$1,061.50

Swarco

$18.00

$900.00 MOBOTREX

$32.00

$1,600.00 Econolite

8" Visor - Universal Yellow Metal Tunnel 50 each

$15.96

Swarco

$798.00

$12.00

$600.00 MOBOTREX

$29.00

$1,450.00 Econolite

17" x 34" x 12" Service Box, Precast,

8 each
polymet concrete

No Bid

No Bid

$645.00

$5,160.00

Armorcast

Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.

Cubic ITS, Inc.

General Traffic Equipment Corp

Arlington, TX Sugar Land, TX Newburgh, NY
817-233-9851 281-240-7233 845-569-9000
TOTAL BID AWARD $17,128.00 $0.00 $360.00

Globe Electric Supply Co.
Houston, TX
832-791-2940

MoboTrex, Inc.
Pflugerville, TX
512-521-3337

Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Arlington, TX
817-831-9406

TOTAL BID AWARD

$10,901.37

$15,242.00

$1,590.00

Recommended for Award
Tie Bid; blind draw determined recommended award
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